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A report on “Tiranga Yatra Hosted by Vidyabharti Trust, Umrakh 2024” 

 

Event Date:  13TH AUGUST 2024 

Event Venue:  Vidyabharti trust college campus 

Event Time:  10:00 AM to 11:00 AM 

Organised By:  Vidyabharti trust 

Academic year:  2024-2025  

In alignment with the nationwide "Har Ghar Tiranga" campaign, Vidyabharti 
Trust, Umrakh, organized a vibrant and patriotic Tiranga Yatra to celebrate 
the spirit of independence and national unity. The event was held with great 

enthusiasm and participation from students, faculty, and staff members, 
symbolizing collective pride in the Indian tricolor. 

Objective of the Yatra 

The Tiranga Yatra aimed to promote the significance of the national flag and 
encourage citizens to display it with pride and respect at their homes. The 
event was also intended to instill a deeper sense of patriotism among the 

participants and the local community, reinforcing the values of freedom, 
unity, and national integrity. 

The Yatra 

The Yatra commenced from the Vidyabharti Trust campus, with a large 
gathering of participants proudly holding the national flag. The procession, 

led by the college administration and faculty members, moved through the 
main streets of Umrakh, attracting the attention and admiration of the local 
community. 

Participants dressed in traditional attire and wore tricolor badges, and the 

Yatra was accompanied by the chanting of patriotic slogans and songs. The 
atmosphere was filled with enthusiasm as students and faculty members 

marched together, waving the Tiranga high. The streets were decorated with 
flags and banners, further amplifying the patriotic spirit of the event. 

Community Engagement 

As the Yatra progressed, local residents joined in, making it a true community 
event. The participants distributed small national flags to the onlookers, 
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encouraging them to hoist the Tiranga at their homes. The college also 
organized a brief address during the Yatra, where faculty members spoke 
about the significance of the "Har Ghar Tiranga" initiative and the role of every 

citizen in upholding the dignity of the national flag. 

Conclusion 

The Tiranga Yatra hosted by Vidyabharti Trust, Umrakh, was a resounding 
success. It not only brought together the college community but also engaged 
the local population in the patriotic fervor of the "Har Ghar Tiranga" 

campaign. The event served as a powerful reminder of the importance of unity 
and the pride associated with the national flag. It reinforced the values of 

independence and national pride among the participants, making it a 
memorable and impactful celebration of the spirit of freedom. 

The event concluded with the participants singing the national anthem, filling 
the air with a deep sense of pride and patriotism. 

Prepared by: Vishwa Bhatt 
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